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Award Indicated By Circle


Tabulation of Bid No. 8589


Opened: 10/10/2017


Tabbed By: NF


State of Nevada - Purchasing Division


515 E. Musser Street/ Suite 300


Carson City, NV 89701


VENDOR
INITALS


ART


CAR


CHA
CIN


COR
GAC
GOA
ICS
KWT
TLS
VS I


VENDOR NAME


Artemis


Carolina Textiles


CHATHAM KNITTING MILLS


CINTAS


Corrections Industries


Great American Shoes


Goaltex Corp


ICS Jail Supplies


Kar Wing Trading


The Liberty Store


Victory Supply, Inc.


Date: April 13, 2018


VENDOR
STATE NET


Not


DELIVERY Days


NV - Based Provided Not Provided


EXCEPTIONS


Not Provided


NC


VA
OH


WA
WI
NY
TX


CA
NY
TH


Not
Provided


30


30


30
45
30
30
30
30
30


30


45
30


45
45
45


14-21


45
14


NO


NO
NO


NO
YES
NO
NO
NO
NO


Not Provided


Awarded By


Reviewed By


AS - As Specified


NS - Not Specified


SB - See Bid


AB - Alternate Bid


AN - Ail or None


Date


Date


y-/.^
W)'l^


It No Coinmodity Vendor Quantity Unit Price Extended Price Stat Math List Price
of


Saving Requested Samples


2.1


2.1


2.1


2.1


WORK BOOTS


.WORK BOOTS


GQA


KWT


VSI


COR


ICS


GAC


263.6


2616


2616


2616


2616


2616


14.53


16.30


16.97


20.25


26.60


67.99


38,010.48 38/010,48


42,640.80 42/6^0.80


44,393.52 44,393.52


52,894.00 52,974.00


69,585.60 69/585.60


177/862.00 177/861.84


18,5


28.5


34.99


25.96


94.99


•2U,


43%


52%


22%


28%


^.s^.


lot 15







2.2


2.2


{2,2


2.2


2.2


GOA


VSI


SLIP.-ON CANVAS,.. WHITE ICS


KWT


COR


9211


9211


9211


9211


9211


3.12


4.11


5,2^


5.89


6.70


28,738.32 28,738.32


37,857.21 37,857.21


48,357.75 •4.8/357.75


54,252.79 54/252.79


61,714.00 61,713.70


4.25


7.49


9.99


7.58


27%


45%


41%


12%


SXiIP-ON CANVSS/ BLACK


3.12


4.11


23/556.00 23,556.00


31,030.50 31/030.50


5.25


5.89


6.70


39,637.50 39/637.!50


44,469.50 44/469.50


50,585.00 50/585.00


4.25


7.49


9.99


7.58


27%


45%


41%


12%


v^\


2.1 - 2.3


2.1 - 2.3


2.1 - 2.3


2.1 - 2.3


2.1 - 2.3


2.2 - 2.3


WORK BOOTS & CANVAS


CANVAS


ART


CAR


CHA


C IN


TLS


GAC


NO BID


NO BID


NO BID


NO BID


NO BID


NO BID


NO BID


NO BID


NO BID


NO BID


NO BID


NO BID
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Men1 s WMte SHo"
Sleeve Crew Neck


Silver State BID; $16,192


15,680.76 16,251.00


17/480.83


17/805.87


26/423.50


28/638.00


2.4


2.4


2.4


2.4


2.4


Sizes: S, M, L, & XL CAR
TLS
ICS
COR
VSI


387
387
387
387
387


15.00


16.49


23.00


30.00


15.87


5,805.00


6/381.63


8,901.00


11,610.00


6,141.69


5,805.00


6,381.63


8,901.00


11/610.00


6,141.69


19.99


35.28
31.98


18%


15%
50%


2.5


2.5


2.5


2.5


2.5


Sizes: 2XL, 3XL/ & 4XL CAR
VS I
TLS
COR
ICS


470
470
470
470
470


21.00


23.11


23.32


34.80


35.75


9,870.00


10,861.70


10,960.40


16,356.00


16,802.50


9/870.00


10,861.70


10,960.40


16/356.00


16,802.50


42.59
24.99
55.68


46%
7%


38%


2.6


2.6


2.6


2.6


2.6


2.4


2.4


2.4


2.4


2.4


2.4


2.6


2.6


2.6


2.6


2.6


2.6


Sizes: bXL, bXL, &


NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID


All or None was not
provided


7XL TLS
VSI
CAR
COR
ICS


CHA
CIN
GAC
GOA
KWT


ART


16
16
16
16
16


NO
NO
NO
NO
NO


BID
BID
BID
BID
BID


28.99


29.84


36.00


36.00


45.00


463.84


477.44


576.00


672.00


720.00


NO
NO
NO
NO
NO


BID
BID
BID


BID
BID


463.


477.


576.


576.


720.


84
44
00
00
00


29
56


87


.99


.98


.36


3%
48%


59%


Vendor Rejected
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2.7 -


2.7 -


2.7 -


2.7 -


2.7


2.7


2.7


2.7


2.7


2.9


2.9


2.9


2.9


2.9


Silver State BID: $34/602.00


Men's White Boxer
Shorts


Sizes: S/ M, L, & XL


TLS
CAR
VS I
IC3
COR


TLS
CAR
VS I
ICS
COR


2050
2050
2050
2050
2050


9.50


12.13


17.65


18.00


34/654.94


35/564.00


47/778.83


64/755.70


67/337.60


18,204.00


19,475.00


24,866.50


36,182.50


36,900.00


34,654.94


35/564.00


47,778.43


64/755.70


67,155.60


18,204.00


19,475.00


24,866.50


36/182.50


36,900.00


^-^


10.99


25.52


19.08


19%


52%


6%


2.8


2.8


2.8


2.8


2.8


Sizes: 2XL/ 3XL, & 4XL TLS
CAR
VS I
ICS
COR


627
627
627
627
627


10.38


11.00


14.87


17.90


20.40


6,508.26


6/897.00


9,323.49


11,223.30


12,790.80


6,508.26


6,897.00


9,323.49


11,223.30


12,790.80


11.99


29.92


21.84


13%


50%


7%


2.9


2.9


2.9


2.9


2.9


2.7


2.7


2.7


2


g


.9


.9


.9


Sizes:


ALL
ALL
ALL


OR
OR
OR


</


NONE
NONE
NONE


CAR
TLS
VS I
ICS
COR


CHA
GAC
GOA


766
766
766
766
766


NO
NO
NO


BID
BID


BID


12.00


12.98


17.74


22.65


22.80


9,192.00


9,942.65


13/588.84


17,349.90


17/646.80


NO
NO
NO


9,192.00


9,942.68


13,588.84


17,349.90


17,464.80


BID
BID
BID


14
38


27


.99


.84


.96


13%
54%


18%


2,10 - .2.11 M^n • SL-EIfa.Ltifi Tn^ ^r.^ CAR
Z....10 "-"Zj-l


,2.. 10..- 2.11 Men's White Tub Socks


TLS
vsx


2TTO—27TT
2.10 - 2.11


COR
ICS


19._1.68_.8a_ ..-


22,683.OS


29,~5T^n^~"


35,599.20


;17/'736._;4a.


J^JJ
22,683.08


-26780T72rO


35,599.20
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2.10


2.10


2.10


2.10


2.10


2.11


2.11


2.11


2.11


2.11


2.10 - 2.11 NO BID


2.10 - 2.11 NO BID


2.10 - 2.11 NO BID


2.10 - 2.11 NO BID


2.10-2.11 NO BID


Sizes: 9 1/2 to 14 CAR
TLS
VS I
COR
ICS


4125
4125
4125
4125
4125


Sizes: 10 to 13 TLS
CAR
VS I
COR
ICS


439
439
439
439
439


CHA
CIN
GAC
GOA
KWT


NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID


NO BID


3.84


4.20


4.97


5.88


7.80


4.20


4.32


4.97


5.80


7.80


15,840.00


17,325.00


20/501.25


26,730.00


32,175.00


1,843.80


1,896.48


2,181.83


2,844.72


3/424.20


NO
NO
NO
NO
NO


15,840.00


17,325.00


20,501.25


24,255.00


32,175.00


1/843.80


1/896.48


2/181.83


2/546.20


3,424.20


BID
BID
BID


BID
BID


6.99
8.97


10.32


6.99


8.97


10.32


40%
45%
43%


40%


45%
44%


2,12 Watchmen Caps
"2 .12


2.12


2.12


2.12


2.12


2.12


2.12


2.12


2.12


2.12


2.12


2.12


2.12


CAR
CAR
ICS
ICS
COR


COR


ART
CHA
CIN
GAC
GOA
KWT
TLS
VS I


500


500


500


NO
NO
NO
NO
NO
NO
NO
NO


BID
BID
BID
BID
BID
BID
BID
BID


0.85


1.33


2.75


425.00


T8-,161.48


665.00


1,375.00


1,375.00


NO
NO
NO
NO
NO
NO
NO
NO


1
1


BID
BID
BID


BID
BID
BID


BID
BID


425.00^
425.00


665.00


665.00


,375.00


,375.00


3.89 29%
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^-u-
'2.13


2.13


2.13


2.13


2.15


2.15


2.15


^VSI_


TLS
CAR
COR
ICS


14,_118.28


.14,776.08.


15/693.50


22,803.40


24,597.65


14/118.34


Ji,776.08"^)
15,693-.-50~


22,701.36


24,597.65


2.13


2.13


2.13


2.13


2.13


2.14


2.14


2.14


2.14


2.14


2.15


Sizes: 36D TO 46D/
48DD, 48E CAR


VS I
IC3
COR
TLS


2
2
2
2
2


Sports Bra


Sizes: M,L, XL OR
Comparable Sizing


Sports Bra


Sizes: 2XL,3XL OR


VSI


TLS
CAR
COR
ICS


VS I


699


699
699
699
699


157


2.15


2.15


2.15


2.13 -


2.13 -


2.13 -


2.13 -


2.13 -


2.13 -


2.15


2.15


2.15


2.15


2.15


2.15


Comparable


ALL
ALL
ALL
ALL
ALL
ALL


OR
OR
OR
OR
OR
OR


NONE
NONE
NONE
NONE
NONE
NONE


25.00


29.95


34.65


36.00


38.40


16.24


17.04


18.00


26.04


27.60


17.24


TLS
CAR
COR


ART
CHA
CIN
GAC
KWT
GOA


157
157
157


NO
NO
NO
NO
NO
NO


BID
BID
BID
BID
BID
BID


17
19
28


.76


.50


.20


50.00


59.84


69.30


174.00


76.80


11,351.76


11,910.96


12,582.00


18/202.00


19,292.40


2,706.68


2,788.32


3,061.50


4,427.40


NO
NO
NO
NO
NO
NO


50.


59.


69.


72.


76.


11,351.


11,910.


12,582.


18,201.


19,292.


2,706.


2,788.


3,061.


4/427.


BID
BID
BID
BID
BID
BID


00
90
30
00
80


76


96
00
96
40


68


32
50
40


67.58


36.93
42.5


39.84


19.99


42.95


42.69


19.99


48.95


56^


3%
10%


59%


15%


39%


60%


11%


42%
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•2.16 - 2.17 Women's Panties


"6 - 2.17


2.16 - 2.17


2.16 - 2.17


2.16 - 2.17


VSJ


CAR
TLS
COR
ICS


Sizes: 5/6, & 7


Sizes: 8-13


2.16


2.16


2.16


2.16


2.16


2.17


2.17


2.17


2.17


2.17


2.16 - 2.17 ALL OR NONE


2.16 - 2.17 ALL OR NONE


2.16 - 2.17 ALL OR NONE


2.16 - 2.17 ALL OR NONE


VS I
CAR
TLS
COR
ICS


VS I
CAR
TLS
COR
ICS


441
441
441
441
441


377
377
377
377
377


ART


CHA
CIN
GAC


NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID


6.68


7.20


7.56


10.80


12.20


7.11


7.20


7.79


11.40


13.35


-5_,_626.50


5/889.60


6/270.79


9/060.60


10,413.15


2,945.88


3,175.20


3,333.96


4,762.80


5,380.20


2,680.47


2/714.40


29,368.83


4,297.80


5,032.95


NO
NO
NO
NO


5,626.50^


5,889.60


6,270.79


9,060.60


10,413.15


2,945.88


3,175.20


3,333.96


4/762.80


5/380.20


2/680.47


2,714.40


2/936.83


4/297.80


5,032.95


BID
BID
BID


BID


14.22


9.99
13.84


17.24


9.99


17.96


53%


24%
22%


59%


22%
37%


':^


:^
<^^


2.18 - 2.2.L


2.18.- 2.21 Thermal Underwear


2.18 - 2.21


ISJ-


CAR
COR
ICS


_9^715.76


10/603.20


21,798.66'


22/142.40


9,715.76


10^603.20


'°^T7778T7y


22,142.40


'?i
mx^


2.18


2.18


2.18


2.18


Crew Neck Long Sleeves


Sizes: S, M, L


VSI
CAR
COR
ICS


57
57
57
57


24.92


28.20


45.60


52.20


1/420.44


1,607.40


2,599.20


2,975.40


1,420.44


1,607.40


2,599.20


2,975.40


56.98 56%


106.80 57%
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2.19


2.19


2.19


2.19


Crew Neck Long Sleeves


Sizes: XL/2XL/3XL/4XL


VS I
CAR
ICS
COR


131
131
131
131


26 .24+E387


28
61
63


.20


.80


.36


3,437.44


3,694.20


8,095.80


8,300.16


ftVALUE!


3,694.20


8/095.80


8,300.16


62.63 ^VALUE'


106.80 41%


2.20


2.20


2.20


2.20


Bottoms - Thermal


Sizes: S, M/ L


VS I
CAR
COR
ICS


57
57
57
57


24.92


28.20


45.60


52.20


1,420.44


1/607.40


2,599.20


2,975.40


1,420.44


1,607.40


2,599.20


2,975.40


56.98


106.80


56^


57%


2.21


2.21


2.21


2.21


Bottoms ~ Thermal


Sizes: XL/2XL,3XL,4XL


VS I
CAR
ICS
COR


131
131
131
131


26.24


28.20


61.80


63.36


3,437.44


3,694.20


8,095.80


8,300.16


3/437.44


3,694.20


8,095.80


8,300.16


62.63


106.80


58%


41%


2.18 - 2.21


2.18 - 2.21


2.18 - 2.21


2.18 - 2.21


2.18 - 2.21


2.18 - 2.21


2.18 ~ 2.21


ALL OR NONE
ALL OR NONE
ALL OR NONE
ALL OR NONE
ALL OR NONE
ALL OR NONE
ALL OR NONE


ART
CHA
CIN
GAC
GOA
KWT
TLS


NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID


NO BID


NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID


NO BID
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^2_- 2. 2 9 _
i2.22 - 2.29 Short Sleeve Postman.


^-. 22 ~~2. 2 9


2.22


2.22


2.22


2.23


2.23


2.23


2.24


2.24


2.24


2.25


2.25


2.25


2.26


2.26


2.26


2.27


2.27


2.27


Size:


Size:


Size:


Size:


Size:


Size;


M


L


XL


2XL


3XL


4 XL


COR
C IN
ICS


COR
CIN
ICS


COR
CIN
ICS


COR
CIN
ICS


COR
GIN
ICS


COR
CIN
ICS


COR
CIN
ICS


1417
1417
1417


1667
1667
1667


4016
4016
4016


4191
4191
4191


1745
1745
1745


355
355
355


Silver State BID: $98,733.53


_98,_874.08 98,871.


118/843.20 ^J.8/843,20 }


.'X''^:'-'.'i


"^•si-:


6.45


8.64


18.50


6.60


8.64


18.50


7.00


8.64


18.50


7.35


8.64


18.95


7.90


8.64


18.95


8.00


8.64


18.95


257,750.25


9,139.65


12/242.88


26/214.50


11,002.20


14/402.88


30,839.50


28,112.00


34,698.24


74,296.00


30,803.85


36,210.24


79,419.45


13,788.50


15/076.80


33,067.75


2,840.00


3,067.20


6,727.25


r,-75Q-::


9,139.65


12,242.88


26,214.50


11,002.20


14,402.88


30,839.50


28/112.00


34/698.24


74,296.00


30,803.85


36,210.24


79,419.45


13,785.50


15,076.80


33,067.75


2,840.00


3,067.20


6,727.25


10.78
22.99


10.93
22.99


11.33
22.99


11.68
26.99


12.23
26.99


12.33
28.99


40§
62%


40%
62%


38%
62%


37%
6S%


35%
68%


35%
70%
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2.28


2.28


2.28


2.29


2.29


Size;


Size:


5 XL


7XL


2.29


2.22


2.22


2.22


2.22


2.22


2.22


2.22


2.22


2.29


2.29


2.29


2.29


2.29


2.29


2.29


2.29


ALL
ALL
ALL
ALL
ALL
ALL
ALL


ALL


OR
OR
OR
OR
OR
OR
OR
OR


NONE
HONE
NONE
NONE
NONE
NONE
NONE
NONE


COR
C IN
ICS


CIN
COR
ICS


ART
CAR
CHA


GAC
GOA
KWT
TLS
VS I


268
268
268


96
96
96


NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID


NO BID
NO BID
NO BID


NO BID


8.51


8.64


18.95


8.64


9.45


21.95


2/280.68


2/315.52


5/078.60


829.44


907.20


2,107.20


2,280.68


2/315.52


5/078.60


829.44


907.20


2,107.20


HO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID


NO BID
NO BID


12.74
28.99


32.99
13.70


33%
70%


74%
31%


X>ong Sleeve Postman


10 - 2.34 ICS


Silver State BID:


5 / 8 5 5 . PQ_^^^a5ULO
7/803.00.


14,811.25 -u7~yll:2b


$5,848.25


2.30


2.30


2.31


2.31


2.31


2.32


2.32


2.32


2.33


2.33


2.33


2.34


2.34


Size:


Size:


Size:


Size:


Size:


L


XL


2XL


3XL


4XL


COR
CIN
COR
CIN
ICS


COR
C IN
ICS


COR
CIN
ICS


COR
C IN


75
75


200
200
200


200
200
200


100
100
100


100
100


7.40


11.56


7.75


11.56


21.35


9.00


11.56


22.35


9.50


11.56


22.35


10.00


11.56


555.00


867.00


1,550.00


2,312.00


4,270.00


1/800.00


2/312.00


4,470.00


950.00


1,156.00


2,235.00


1,000.00


1,156.00


555.00


867.00


1,550.00


2,312.00


4,270.00


1/800.00


2/312.00


4/470.00


950.00


1/156.00


2/235.00


1,000.00


1,156.00


12.84
24.99
13.19
24.99


42%
54%
41%
54%


13.44
28.99


13.94
28.99


14.44
31.99


33%
60%


32%
60%


31%
64%
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2.34 ICS 100 22.35 2,235.00 2,235.00
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2.30


2.30


2.30


2.30


2.30


2.30


2.30


2.30


2.34


2.34


2.34


2.34


2.34


2.34


2.34


2.34


ALL
ALL
ALL
ALL
ALL


ALL
ALL
ALL


OR
OR
OR
OR
OR
OR
OR
OR


NONE
NONE
NONE
NONE
NONE
NONE
NONE
NONE


ART


CAR
CHA
GAC
GOA
KWT
VSI
TLS


NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID


:2.35 - 2.38 Denim Pants


'2TT5~'~°27^T


2.35 - 2.38


2.35 - 2.38


TLS
COR
CIN
ICS


NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
KO BID
NO BID
NO BID


S-ivffT- StatR RTn: 107,738.64


102/766-.'9Q "• laV^Tr.O'O ^ •


137,235.60 137/235.60


211/270.68 211,270.68


244/591.20 244,591.20


2.35


2.35


2.35


2.35


Sizes: 30 - 36 TLS
COR
CIN
ICS


398
398
398
398


106.80


132.00


212.76


229.80


42,506.40 42,506.40


4,378.00 52/536.00


84,678.48 84,678.48


91,460.40 91,460.40


2.36


2.36


2.36


2.36


Sizes: 38 - 42 TLS
COR
CIN
ICS


446
446
446
446


106.80


138.00


212.76


255.60


47,632.80


5/129.00


94,890.96


113/997.60


47,632.80


61,548.00


94,890.96


113/997.60


2.37


2.37


2.37


2.37


Sizes: 44 46 TLS
COR
C IN
ICS


103
103
103
103


118.20


147.60


212.76


255.60


12/174.60


1,266.90


21,914.25


26,326.80


12,174.60


15,202.80


21,914.28


26/326.80


2.38


2.38


2.38


2.38


Sizes: 48 58 TLS
COR
CIN
ICS


46
46
46
46


118.20


172.80


212.76


278.40


453.10


662.40


9,786.96


12,806.40


5,437.20


7/948.80


9/786.96


12/806.40
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2.35


2.35


2.35


2.35


2.35


2.35


2.35


2.38


2.38


2.38


2.38


2.38


2.38


ALL
ALL
ALL
ALL
ALL


ALL
ALL


OR
OR
OR
OR
OR
OR
OR


NONE
NONE
NONE
NONE
NONE
NONE
NONE


ART


CAR
CHA
GAC
GOA
KWT
VSI


NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID


NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID


NO BID
NO BID


NO BID


Tw4.U Pants


COR
TLS.


CIN
ICS


Silver State BID: $147,456.00


172,175,55


231/165.90
237,657.79"


374/945.85


172,175.'


23.1/165.90
~27^T€Scf—r^


374,945.85


^̂


2.39


2.39


2.39


2.39


Sizes: 30 - 36 COR
TLS
CIN
ICS


6195
6195
6195
6195


10.00


14.60


14.99


23.85


61,950.00


90,447.00


92,863.05


147,750.75


61,950.00


90,447.00


92,863.05


147,750.75


13.11
18.95
30.99


24%
23%
52%


2.40


2.40


2.40


2.40


Sizes; 38 - 42 COR
TL3
CIN
ICS


7569
7569
7569
7569


11.50


14.60


14.99


23.85


87,043.50


110,507.40


115,459.31


180,520.65


87,043.50


110,507.40


113,459.31


180,520.65


14.61
18.99
30.99


21%
23%
52%


2.41


2.41


2.41


2.41


Sizes: 44 - 46 COR
TLS
CIN
ICS


1506
1506
1506
1506


11.50


14.85


14.99


23.85


17,319.00


22,364.10


22,574.94


35,918.10


17/319.00


22,364.10


22,574.94


35,918.10


14.61
21.50
30.99


21%
31%
52%


2.42


2.42


2.42


2.42


Sizes: 58 COR
CIN
TLS
ICS


451
451
451
451


13.00


14.99


17.40


23.85


5,863.00


6/760.49


7/847.40


10/756.35


5,863.00


6,760.49


7,847.40


10,756.35


16.05
30.99
23.50


19%
52%
26%


2.39


2.39


2.39


2.39


2.39


2.39


2.42


2.42


2.42


2.42


2.42


2.42


ALL


ALL
ALL
ALL
ALL
ALL


OR
OR
OR
OR
OR
OR


NONE
NONE
NONE
NONE
NONE
NONE


ART
CAR
CHA
GAC
GOA
KWT


NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID


NO BID


NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
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2.39 2.42 ALL OR NONE VS I NO BID NO BID


2.44


^2, 43_^J^jt4^^gBAHUIa£k^^
2.43


2.43


2.44


2.44


_COR


CHA_


CIN
ICS


Silver State BID: $37,007.00


3Z^5^L__JJ^J.^
53/135,00 53,135.00


~~~'TST3s7T=Ty


78/159.00 78,159.00


^^


^^


2.43


2.43


2.43


2.43


2.44


2.44


2.44


2.44


2.43


2.43


2.43


2.43


2.43


2.43


Sizes: M/L,XL


g 44
2.44


2.44


2.44


2.44


2.44


Sizes: 2XL,3XL,4XL


2.43 - 2.44


ALL OR NONE
ALL OR NONE
ALL OR NONE
ALL OR NONE
ALL OR NONE
ALL OR NONE
ALL OR NONE


COR
CHA
CIN
ICS


COR
CHA
C IN
ICS


ART
CAR
GAC
GOA
KWT
TLS
VS I


710
710
710
710


869
869
869
869


NO
NO
NO
NO
NO
NO
NO


BID


BID
BID
BID
BID
BID


BID


20.33


32.00


44.78


47.05


26.10


35.00


50.15


51.50


14,434.30


22,720.00


31,793.80


33,405.50


22/680.90


30/415.00


43/580.35


44,753.50


NO
NO
NO
NO
NO
NO
NO


14/434.30


22,720.00


31,793.80


33/405.50


22,680.90


30,415.00


43,580.35


44,753.50


BID
BID
BID


BID
BID
BID
BID


35
60


53.98


48
60


64.98


42%
47%
17%


46%
42%
23%


-,45,_2^J^
2.45 - 2.46


~T7^~~~T~^
2.45 - 2.46


Twill Jackets


COR
GIN
CHA
IC3


Silver State BID: $76,117.80


113,357.08 76/241.88


98,710.02 98,710.02:~^


119,898.00


149,731.20


119/898.00


149,731.20
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2.45


2.45


2.45


2.45


Sizes: M,L,XL COR
CIN
CHA
ICS


1812
1812
1812
1812


18.38


25.99


30.00


36.60


33/304.56


47,093.88


54,360.00


66,319.20


33,304.56


47,093.88


54/360.00


66,319.20


24.36
46.99
58.00


25%
45%
48%


2.46


2.46


2.46


2.46


Sizes: 2XL,3XL,4XL COR
CIN
CHA


ICS


1986
1986
1986
1986


21.62


25.99


33.00


42.00


42,937.32 42,937.32


51,616.14 51,616.14


65,533.00 65,538.00


83,412.00 83,412.00


29.01
54.99
61.00


25%
53%
46%


2.45


2.45


2.45


2.45


2.45


2.45


2.46


2.46


2.46


2.46


2.46


2.46


ALL
ALL
ALL
ALL
ALL
ALL


OR
OR
OR
OR
OR
OR


NONE
NONE
NONE
NONE
NONE
NONE


CAR
GAC
GOA
KWT
TL3
VS I


NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID


NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID


NO BID
NO BID
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April 13, 2018

***NOTICE OF AWARD***

A Notice of Award discloses the selected vendor(s) and the intended contract terms resulting from a

State issued solicitation document.  Contract for the services of an independent contractor does not 

become effective unless and until approved by the Board of Examiners.


		OTC Bid #:

		8589





		For:

		Inmate Clothing, Sneakers, and Boots





		Vendor:

		Kar Wing Trading


ICS Jail Supplies


Victory Supply, Inc.


Silver State Industries 

Carolina Textiles


The Liberty Store


CINTAS


Chatham Knitting Mills

Correctional Industries


Goaltek Corp.

		$ 42,640.80


$ 87,995.25


$ 45,790.41


$ 34,602.00


$ 28,764.68

$353,692.98


$225,356.22


$ 53,135.00

$172,175.55


$38,010.48





		Term:

		April 15, 2018 through April 14, 2020



		

		





		Using Agency:

		Nevada Department of Corrections





************************************************************************************


This Notice of Award has been posted in the following locations:


		State Library and Archives

		100 N. Stewart Street

		Carson City



		State Purchasing

		515 E. Musser Street

		Carson City



		Department of Corrections

		550 Snyder Ave.

		Carson City





Pursuant to NRS 333.370, any unsuccessful proposer may file a Notice of Appeal


 within 10 days after the date of this Notice of Award.


NOTE:  This notice shall remain posted through April 24, 2018 @ 5:00 p.m.

Revised as of 10/05/11



