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Licensed, Bonded and Insured 

Nevada State Contractors’ License (No. 67759) 

Nevada Pest Control License (No. 6747) 

Nevada State Business License (No. NV20001359816) 

Clark County Business License (No. 1000003-511)) 

City of Boulder City Business License (No. 3-4-02-9403-0) 

City of Henderson Multi-Jurisdiction Business License (No. 2000510505) 

(Also includes the additional non-primary jurisdictions:   

Clark County, Las Vegas, North Las Vegas) 

 

City of Las Vegas Business License (No. T09-00178-A-083474) 

City of North Las Vegas Business License (No. 87049)  

Certificate of General Liability, Auto and Workers’ Compensation Insurance 

 

 

 

 

 



















INSR ADDL SUBR
LTR INSR WVD

DATE (MM/DD/YYYY)

PRODUCER CONTACT
NAME:

FAXPHONE
(A/C, No):(A/C, No, Ext):

E-MAIL
ADDRESS:

INSURER A :

INSURED INSURER B :

INSURER C :

INSURER D :

INSURER E :

INSURER F :

POLICY NUMBER
POLICY EFF POLICY EXP

TYPE OF INSURANCE LIMITS(MM/DD/YYYY) (MM/DD/YYYY)

GENERAL LIABILITY

AUTOMOBILE LIABILITY

UMBRELLA LIAB

EXCESS LIAB

WORKERS COMPENSATION
AND EMPLOYERS' LIABILITY

DESCRIPTION OF OPERATIONS / LOCATIONS / VEHICLES (Attach ACORD 101, Additional Remarks Schedule, if more space is required)

AUTHORIZED REPRESENTATIVE

INSURER(S) AFFORDING COVERAGE NAIC #

Y / N

N / A
(Mandatory in NH)

ANY PROPRIETOR/PARTNER/EXECUTIVE
OFFICER/MEMBER EXCLUDED?

EACH OCCURRENCE $
DAMAGE TO RENTED

COMMERCIAL GENERAL LIABILITY $PREMISES (Ea occurrence)

CLAIMS-MADE OCCUR MED EXP (Any one person) $

PERSONAL & ADV INJURY $

GENERAL AGGREGATE $

GEN'L AGGREGATE LIMIT APPLIES PER: PRODUCTS - COMP/OP AGG $

$PRO-
POLICY LOCJECT

COMBINED SINGLE LIMIT
$(Ea accident)

BODILY INJURY (Per person) $ANY AUTO
ALL OWNED SCHEDULED BODILY INJURY (Per accident) $
AUTOS AUTOS

HIRED AUTOS
NON-OWNED PROPERTY DAMAGE $
AUTOS (Per accident)

$

OCCUR EACH OCCURRENCE $

CLAIMS-MADE AGGREGATE $

DED RETENTION $ $
WC STATU- OTH-
TORY LIMITS ER

E.L. EACH ACCIDENT $

E.L. DISEASE - EA EMPLOYEE $
If yes, describe under

E.L. DISEASE - POLICY LIMIT $DESCRIPTION OF OPERATIONS below

SHOULD ANY OF THE ABOVE DESCRIBED POLICIES BE CANCELLED BEFORE
THE    EXPIRATION   DATE    THEREOF,    NOTICE   WILL   BE   DELIVERED   IN
ACCORDANCE   WITH   THE   POLICY   PROVISIONS.

THIS  IS  TO  CERTIFY  THAT  THE  POLICIES  OF  INSURANCE  LISTED  BELOW  HAVE BEEN ISSUED  TO THE  INSURED  NAMED ABOVE  FOR THE  POLICY PERIOD
INDICATED.   NOTWITHSTANDING  ANY   REQUIREMENT,  TERM  OR  CONDITION OF  ANY  CONTRACT OR  OTHER  DOCUMENT  WITH  RESPECT  TO  WHICH  THIS
CERTIFICATE  MAY  BE  ISSUED  OR  MAY  PERTAIN,   THE  INSURANCE  AFFORDED  BY  THE  POLICIES  DESCRIBED  HEREIN  IS  SUBJECT  TO  ALL  THE  TERMS,
EXCLUSIONS  AND  CONDITIONS  OF  SUCH  POLICIES.   LIMITS  SHOWN  MAY  HAVE  BEEN  REDUCED  BY  PAID  CLAIMS.

THIS CERTIFICATE IS ISSUED AS A MATTER OF INFORMATION ONLY AND CONFERS NO RIGHTS UPON THE CERTIFICATE HOLDER. THIS
CERTIFICATE DOES NOT AFFIRMATIVELY OR NEGATIVELY AMEND, EXTEND OR ALTER THE COVERAGE AFFORDED BY THE POLICIES
BELOW. THIS CERTIFICATE OF INSURANCE DOES NOT CONSTITUTE A CONTRACT BETWEEN THE ISSUING INSURER(S), AUTHORIZED
REPRESENTATIVE OR PRODUCER, AND THE CERTIFICATE HOLDER.

IMPORTANT: If the certificate holder is an ADDITIONAL INSURED, the policy(ies) must be endorsed. If SUBROGATION IS WAIVED, subject to
the terms and conditions of the policy, certain policies may require an endorsement. A statement on this certificate does not confer rights to the
certificate holder in lieu of such endorsement(s).

COVERAGES CERTIFICATE NUMBER: REVISION NUMBER:

CERTIFICATE HOLDER CANCELLATION

© 1988-2010 ACORD CORPORATION. All rights reserved.

The ACORD name and logo are registered marks of ACORDACORD 25 (2010/05)

ACORDTM CERTIFICATE OF LIABILITY INSURANCE 10/10/2011

Hub International
HUB Int'l Insurance Serv. Inc.
P.O. Box 3310
Santa Barbara, CA  93130-3310

805-682-2571 805-832-6581

First Choice Tree Service, Inc.
P.O. Box 43056
Las Vegas, NV  89116

Sparta Insurance Company
Ohio Casualty Insurance Company

20613
24074

A
X

X
X PD Ded:1,000

021CP00686 10/09/2011 10/09/2012 1,000,000
100,000
5,000
1,000,000
2,000,000
2,000,000

A
X

X X

021CP00686 10/09/2011 10/09/2012 1,000,000

B
X

X

X 0

1EUO1254276913 10/09/2011 10/09/2012 3,000,000
3,000,000

A

Y

021WK00139 08/01/2011 08/01/2012 X
1,000,000

1,000,000
1,000,000

PROOF OF INSURANCE ONLY.

PROOF OF INSURANCE ONLY
  

1 of 1
#S1351013/M1350999

FIRSCHOI14Client#: 572602

IG42
1 of 1

#S1351013/M1350999


susanculetsu
Text Box
Please see next page for current Workers Compensation policy period 8/01/2012 thru 8/01/2013



CERTIFICATE 
Workers' Compensation Coverage 

 
575 S. Saliman Road, Carson City, NV 89701-5000 

Phone: (775) 887-2480    Fax: (775) 887-2481 

    ITEM 1.  NAME AND ADDRESS OF MEMBER COMPANY 

                                                                                                                                    Policy No:  
  

    ITEM 2.  LIMITS OF SELF INSURED RESPONSIBILITY 

WORKERS' COMPENSATION STATUTORY 
EMPLOYERS LIABILITY $1,000,000/$1,000,000/$1,000,000 

    ITEM 3.  MEMBER PARTICIPATION INFORMATION 

GROUP CERTIFICATION NUMBER:        
Pursuant to Nevada Revised Statutes 616.3791, 616.37915, and 616.3792 and the Nevada Administration Code.  
The                                                      Self Insured Group has presented evidence they possess the financial 
and administrative resources to assume the responsibility for providing prompt payment of all compensation due 
under Chapters 616 and 617 of the Nevada Revised Statutes, and has been granted the above numbered Certificate, 
granting it authority to act as an Association of Self Insured Public Employers for Workers Compensation Purposes. 

MEMBER NUMBER: MEMBER’S ANNUAL TERM 
   

The above member has presented evidence that it has the financial and administrative resources to participate 
as a member of the                                                     Self Insured Group.  The member has been authorized by the 
Trustees of that Association and the Nevada Insurance Division to participate in the  
Self Insured Group, so long as it continues to abide by the Bylaws of the Association and the applicable provisions
of Chapters 616 and 617 of the Nevada Revised Statutes. 

    ITEM 4.  PREMIUM ASSESSMENT INFORMATION 

The premium assessment for this certificate will be determined by the rates, classifications, and rules utilized by the       
                                                    Self Insured Group as revised from time to time and as filed with and 
approved by the Nevada Insurance Division. 

 Dated At:  Carson City, Nevada 
 This  

  
 Authorized Representative 
                                                                                                                                                      Self Insured Group 

First Choice Tree Service

P O Box 43056 
Las Vegas, NV 89116

NTN10794-2012-01
First Choice Tree Service Inc

Nevada Transportation Network SIG

5001

Nevada Transportation Network

NTN10794 12:01 AM on 08/01/2012 to 12:01 AM on 01/01/2013

Nevada Transportation Network
Nevada Transportation Network

Nevada Transportation Network

Nevada Transportation Network

Wednesday, August 01, 2012









3. SCOPE OF WORK  

 

In order for vendors to be considered for any fire fuels reduction service, proposing vendors must 
provide evidence of the required employee knowledge and skills through experience (attach resumes 
and/or CV), as well as a detailed description of services in the scope of work being proposed upon.  A 
minimum of three years experience in each of the scopes of work being proposed upon is preferred.   

 

3.1 Forest Management Hand Crew Services Specification 

 

3.1.1 The awarded vendor will provide skilled hand crew services to complete forest management-
related work, including but not limited to: 

 

3.1.1.1 Fuels reduction 

3.1.1.2  

3.1.1.3 Tree thinning 

 

3.1.1.4 Wildlife habitat improvement  

 

3.1.1.5 Erosion control  

 

3.1.2 Crews will be provided with written prescriptions that contain specifications and other pertinent 
information for each project. 

 

3.1.3 Travel to worksite may require driving on narrow, winding, native surface roads for long 
distances.  During the summer months, frequent encounters with hikers, mountain bikers, and 
horseback riders should be expected. 

 

3.1.4 Crews must be able to work in difficult terrain that may include steep, rocky slopes, and areas of 
dense trees with large, unstable snags, poor footing and exposure to adverse weather.  In addition, 
some work may be required in urban environments and may contain such hazards as structures, trees, 
power lines, and vehicles. 

 

3.1.5 Work includes lifting rounds of wood and segments of logs, limb wood, and brush. 

 

3.1.6 Tree felling services will include the operation of chainsaws to complete felling, limbing, lopping, 
bucking and brushing activities according to written prescriptions. 

 



3.1.6.1 Tree fellers must be able to directionally fell trees away from residual trees or objects to be 
protected. 

 

3.1.6.2 Tree to be cut larger than six (6) inches in diameter will be marked with paint (color to be 
determined between awarded vendor and State’s designee).  Trees that are less than six (6) inches in 
diameter may be designated by description. 

 

3.1.6.3 Trees range in size from one (1) inch to twenty-four (24) inches DBH. 

 

3.1.6.4 Cut trees in area not designated for firewood sales must be limbed on all sides, bucked into four 
(4) foot lengths and stacked for burning, depending on the prescription. 

 

3.1.6.5 In areas designated for firewood sales, cut trees larger than eight (8) inches in diameter must be 
limbed on all sides, bucked into four (4) foot lengths, and stacked for removal by individuals purchasing 
firewood permits. 

 

3.1.6.6 Borax will be applied to all freshly cut green evergreen tree stumps larger than ten (10) inches in 
diameter to prevent the spread of root disease. 

 

3.1.6.7 Maximum stump height is six (6) inches above high ground level. 

 

3.1.6.8 Trees that are less than six (6) inches must be flush cut. 

 

3.1.6.9 Typical brush species are primarily ceanothus, manzanita, oak, and chinkapin, and are mostly 
three (3) to six (6) feet high.  Designation for brush removal is generally by description (e.g. remove fifty 
(50) percent of the brush) to reduce fuel continuity. 

 

3.1.7 Disposal of cut material will be accomplished by hand piling for burning, chipping, scattering, 
and/or removal from site, as designated by the project manager.  Any piling must be located so that live 
trees are not scorched during the burning process.  Piling locations will be decided by awarded vendor 
and the State’s designee.  Accurate recordation for hours of use and biomass produced is required. 

 

3.1.8 Erosion control services that may be requested include routine light maintenance on roads and 
trails that can be done by hand, such as digging, trenching and/or removing sedimentation from 
drainage structures installed along park roads and trails.  Other erosion control may include tilling, 
application of fertilizer, seeding, mulching, irrigation, and the application and establishment of erosion 
control materials (i.e., geotextile fabric). 

 



3.1.9 Cost items shall be provided by the vendor to accomplish specific forestry-related tasks using 
the units below: 

 

3.1.9.1 Service associated with scope Cost unit 

 

A.  Tree cutting (felling, limbing, bucking) Acre 

 

B.  Burn pile stacking Acre 

 

C.  Pile burning Acre 

 

D.  Brushing Acre 

 

E.  Chipping Hourly 

 

F.  Fire line construction LF 

 

G.  Mobilization Mile 

 

All other work and materials necessary to complete work (e.g. generator fuel) will be considered 
incidental and included in the payment of cost items. 

  



 

3.2 Large Tree Removal Services Specification 

 

3.2.1 Awarded vendor will provide large tree removal on an as needed basis.  Vendor must be a 
qualified tree worker and must provide certification and/or license information. 

 

3.2.2 Equipment used must be able to operate on uneven, rocky ground. 

 

3.2.3 Equipment used must be able to selectively remove individual trees. 

 

3.2.4 Equipment used must be able to operate in close proximity to homes and other structures. 

 

3.2.5 Trees may be located on parcels owned by the State in Washoe and Douglas Counties, as well as 
rural Carson City, on the Nevada side of the Lake Tahoe Basin, in addition to other locations throughout 
the State. 

 

3.2.6 Tree stumps shall be cut to a height of six (6) inches or what is deemed to be appropriate based 
on site limitations (to be determined by State’s designee and awarded vendor), and then treated with a 
borax solution.  If the entire tree is not specified for removal, then logs remaining on the lot must be 
bucked as necessary to insure that each log or log segment is completely on the ground, and is located 
on State property. 

 

3.2.7 All hazard trees must be limbed, and the slash must be removed from the property, or chipped, 
blown and scattered on the property as directed by the State’s designee.  Wood chips left on the parcel 
must not exceed two (2) inches in depth. 

 

3.2.8 If project specifications include that the awarded vendor remove materials for commercial 
purposes, then the awarded vendor may be expected to reduce or negotiate their fees.  Vendors must 
indicate in their response whether or not they will remove materials for commercial purposes, and if so, 
define their process and fee schedule, along with their willingness to negotiate when appropriate. 

 

3.2.9 Upon receipt of a work order, the awarded vendor shall transport a work crew and equipment 
to the job site and have all work completed within thirty (30) days. 

 

3.2.10 The awarded vendor’s activities upon any State property shall be confined to spaces, areas, 
roads and locations as directed by the State’s designee. 

 



3.2.11 The awarded vendor will work only on normal workdays, Monday through Friday, and between 
the hours of 8:00 a.m. and 5:00 p.m.  After hours work and work on Saturdays, Sundays, and State 
holidays will not be permitted unless the awarded vendor obtains written approval from the State’s 
designee. 

 

3.2.12 Services will be provided by the vendor to accomplish large tree removal using the units below: 

 

3.2.12.1 Class A:  Any tree that can be laid down with a clear path on said property.  (e.g., A 200’ 
tree or a 30’ tree regardless of the height and diameter, if the tree has a clear path to fall and can be 
easily topped and limbed.  This job would require one (1) or more people). 

 

3.2.12.2 Class B:  Any tree needing to be climbed, trimmed, topped and pieced out.  (This job 
requires a climber/faller and one or more ground person). 

 

3.2.12.3 Class C:  Mechanical involvement required.  (e.g., Crane job – 100’ crane.  This job would 
require two (2) or more people). 

 

3.2.13 Appropriate signage meeting State Highway and local county jurisdiction’s requirements must 
be provided by awarded vendor. 

  



 

3.3 Forestry Equipment Specification 

 

3.3.1 Vendors must indicate in their response the manufacturer and model of available equipment, 
the capabilities of the equipment, and the operator/crews available to man the equipment. 

 

3.3.2 Equipment to be utilized on fuels management and/or forest health projects may include, but is 
not necessarily limited to: 

 

3.3.2.1 Tree shears 

 

3.3.2.2 Brush masticators – light, medium, and heavy duty 

 

3.3.2.3 Feller bunchers 

 

3.3.2.4 Forwarders 

 

3.3.2.5 Cut to length operators 

 

3.3.2.6 Heavy cranes 

 

3.3.2.7 Wheeled skidders 

 

3.3.2.8 Tracked skidders 

 

3.3.2.9 Tub grinders 

 

3.3.2.10 Chippers 

 

3.3.3 Awarded vendor will be required to supply operator(s), equipment transport, and if applicable, 
water for fire suppression/dust abatement. 

 

3.3.4 General project specifications (project specific specifications will be described in a scope of work 
prior to commencement of each project): 



 

3.3.4.1 All vegetation and slash indentified for treatment shall be cut at a maximum of six (6) inches 
above the normal plane of ground (measured at stump height on uphill side) 

 

3.3.4.2 No slash and other vegetative debris shall be more than twelve (12) inches deep as measured 
from the ground level 

 

3.3.4.3 No damage to crop trees as a result of contract operations is permitted 

 

3.3.4.4 All cut vegetation shall be kept within unit boundaries 

 

3.3.4.5 Any cut vegetation falling into ditches, roads, road banks, trails or adjacent units shall 
immediately be removed by the end of the work day 

 

3.3.4.6 No masticated or cut material shall lean against or be suspended by leave trees 

 

3.3.4.7 Vegetation that is within two (2) feet vertical or horizontal of any obstacle such as large rocks or 
fences will not require treatment 

 

3.3.4.8 All boles or pieces up to ten (10) inches in diameter shall be masticated 

 

3.3.5 Specifications for cut material (slash): 

 

3.3.5.1 Fifty (50) percent shall be less than or equal to six (6) inches in length 

 

3.3.5.2 Forty (40) percent shall be less than or equal to two (2) feet in length 

 

3.3.5.3 Ten (10) percent shall be less than or equal to two (2) to four (4) feet in length 

 

3.4 Pesticide Application Specification 

 

3.4.1 In accordance with NRS 555, vendors must have a Nevada Custom Pest Control 

 

3.4.2 License issued by the Nevada Department of Agriculture in the appropriate pesticide category(s) 
prior to submitting a proposal. Questions regarding this requirement should be addressed to the Nevada 



Department of Agriculture at (775) 688-1180.  Any response submitted by a non-licensed vendor, or 
vendor that has “applied for” a license, will not be accepted.  A copy of the license or the license number 
must be submitted with response. 

 

3.4.3 Records, application documentation and labels must be available on site. 

 

3.4.4 Awarded vendor must have the ability to take spot weather to determine temperature, wind 
speed, and relative humidity. 

 

3.4.5 Spot, whole tree, and broadcast treatments may be required in some cases. 

 

3.4.6 Application equipment that is carried by hand, on ATV’s, as a slide in unit on a truck, or purpose 
built spray equipment on specialized vehicles may be required. 

 

3.4.7 Application equipment must be cleaned daily and must be easily operable and easily metered. 

 

3.4.8 To prevent drift, spraying operations will be halted when sustained wind speed is greater than 
or equal to eight (8) mph, or when the State’s designee determines that there is the potential for drift 
off the project site. 

 

3.4.9 Routine inspections will be done by a qualified State designee. 

 

3.4.10 Mixing tanks must be equipped with portable containment systems and clean-up 
materials/tools. 

 

3.4.11 Metering equipment and replacement spray nozzles must be available on project site. 

 

3.4.12 Awarded vendor for Pesticide Application will be required to carry Pollution Liability and 
Pollution Legal Liability Insurance.  (See Attachment E of this document for minimum requirements). 

 

3.4.13 If preventative tree spraying is done, tank pressures need to be at least 400 pounds per square 
inch (psi) in order to reach the tops of some trees. 

 

3.4.14 Whole tree bark beetle preventative insecticide spraying will require that the main trunk is 
sprayed until dripping up to a top diameter of five (5) inches. 

 



 

3.6 Hauling Services Specification 

 

3.6.1 Awarded vendor will drop off container on project site (roll on, roll off system). 

 

3.6.2 Container must be capable of holding woody biomass (chipped or unchipped; but not in the 
same container).  

 

3.6.3 Available container volumes should be ten (10), twenty (20), and thirty (30) cubic yards, or 
volume specified by State’s designee. 

 

3.6.4 The containers will be hauled by the awarded vendor from project sites to landfills, power 
plants, or biomass recycling centers on specially constructed heavy trucks. 

 

3.6.5 Cost to include container rental, fuel, distance to the drop point, tipping fees, and biomass price 
per dry ton (if hauling to a biomass energy generator). 

 

3.6.6 Awarded vendor may be requested to remove previously cut fuel wood from a project site.  
Vendors should include in their response a minimum bid per cord that will be paid to the State Agency 
awarding the project to remove fuel wood or other by-products for commercial sale and a listing of 
available equipment necessary to complete this task. 

 

See Qualifications and staff resumes under Technical Proposal  
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Request for Proposal #1995- Fire Fuels Reduction Services


Scope 3.8 Controlled Fire


Service Cost Unit
Qualified Burn Boss Hour
Qualified Ignition Boss Hour
Qualified Lighters Hour
Qualified Holding Boss Hour
Holding Crew Hour
Holding Engine Hour


Normal business hours (8:00 A.M. to 
5:00 P.M. M-F) Hour
After hours (5:01 P.M. to 7:59 A.M. M-F) Hour
Emergency service calls Hour


Proposer Name:   First Choice Tree Service, Inc.


Price 
No Bid


No Bid
No Bid
No Bid


Hourly rates/fees for additional services not included above


No Bid
No Bid
No Bid


List any other associated charges not included above.  Attach additional sheets if 
necessary


No Bid
No Bid
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